
Privacy Policy 

Kojex International Inc. is committed to protecting the privacy and the 
confidentiality of our web site visitors.  

Kojex International Inc. collects personal information only on a volunteer basis. 
This is done when you fill out a web form and send it to us for marketing purposes 
such as contests or promotions, for contacting us, technical support questions or 
just to make a comment. 

In certain situations, we need to share your personal information with third parties. 
For example, we may be required to disclose your personal information in order to 
administer your account. In other cases, we may share personally identifiable 
information with trusted third parties for service provision or marketing. Your 
consent to disclosure or information for this purpose is presumed unless you 
specifically withdraw your consent in the manner provided below. Disclosure of 
your personal information may also be required in other situations, for example 
disclosure may be required by law. 

In some cases we may also collect and use your information on an aggregate basis, 
for example your demographic or usage information. We do this for marketing 
purposes, to improve or launch new products or services, and to study trends, 
among other things. 

Kojex International Inc. does not rent, sell, or share personal information about 
you with other people or non-affiliated companies except to provide products and 
services you’ve requested, when we have your permission, or under the following 
circumstances. We provide the information to trusted partners who work on behalf 
of Kojex International Inc. under confidentiality agreements. These companies may 
use your personal information to help Kojex International Inc. communicate with 
you about offers from Kojex International Inc. and our marketing partners. 
However, these companies do not have any independent right to share this 
information. We believe it is necessary to share information in order to investigate, 
prevent, or take action regarding illegal activities, suspected fraud, situations 
involving potential threats to the physical safety of any person, violations of  Kojex 
International’ terms of use, or as otherwise required by law. 

 

 


